
Re: Scanned from MFP07271411 29/11/2012 10:18
From: Nicole Hatton <nicole.hatton@parliament.nsw.gov.au>
To: "Elliott, Phil" <phil.elliott@riverinastrata.com.au>
Date: Thu, 29 Nov 2012 14:02:23 +1100

Okey Dokey....

Thanks

>>> Phil Elliott <phil.elliott@riverinastrata.com.au> 11/29/2012 1:09 pm >>>
Hello Nicole
I will issue a receipt when the funds are deposited. In the meantime the tax invoice will act as
documentation
Thanks
Phil

Sent from my iPad

On 29/11/2012, at 11:23 AM, "Nicole Hatton" <Nicole.Hatton@parliament.nsw.gov.au> wrote:

> 
> Hi Phil,
> 
> here is a copy of the invoice for Lydia for our records,  they are coming in today to pay.
> 
> Do you want to me to make a receipt template or do you?
> 
> Thanks
> NIcole
>
> 
> 
> >>> "Scanner" <toshibamfd@parliament.nsw.gov.au> 11/29/2012 9:18 am >>>
> Scanned from MFP07271411
>
> 
> 
> Date: 29/11/2012 10:18
> Pages: 1
> Resolution: 200x200 DPI
> ----------------------------------------
> 
> <DOC291112.pdf>
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